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ACKNOWLEDGEMENT OF RESPONSIBILITIES AND CONDITIONS OF 
PARTICIPATION IN THE  

FEDERAL AVIATION ADMINISTRATION 
UNMANNED AIRCRAFT SYSTEM REMOTE IDENTIFICATION DEMONSTRATION 

 
Name:  ____________________________________________  Date: _____________________  
 
 
Signature:  ____________________________________________________________________ 
   
 
As a condition of my participation in the Federal Aviation Administration (FAA) Unmanned 
Aircraft System (UAS) Remote Identification Demonstration (the Event), I acknowledge and 
agree to the following: 
 
____. I will not make any video or sound recordings or take any still photographs of the Event. 
 
____. I will not post information about or otherwise discuss the Event on social media platforms, 
including but not limited to LinkedIn, Facebook, Instagram, and Twitter. 
 
____. I acknowledge that the Remote Identification of Unmanned Aircraft Systems final rule is 
under development and that any discussion of the rule must be limited to publicly available 
information. I will NOT discuss the U.S. government position, deliberations, investigations; and 
any other activity involved in the regulatory and rulemaking process with any individuals outside 
of the U.S. government.  
 
____. I acknowledge that under the Department of Transportation and Federal Aviation 
Administration rules, any discussion of the rule between a federal employee and any other non-
federal attendee, including providing opinions or commentary on what provisions should or 
should not be in the rule, must be summarized and posted to the Remote Identification of 
Unmanned Aircraft Systems rulemaking docket. I further acknowledge that if the FAA becomes 
aware that I have engaged in such conversations and I have not submitted a summary, the FAA 
will submit a summary on my behalf. 
 
____. I acknowledge that in the course my attendance of any portion of the Event, that I may 
learn about or may have access to Information. For the purposes of this agreement, the term 
Information is defined as, but not limited to, proprietary information, sensitive unclassified 
information, and information of a confidential nature belonging to either the United States 
government or private entities in any medium or format.  
 
____. I will NOT discuss, divulge, or disclose any Information to any unauthorized person or 
entity. I will safeguard and prevent the unauthorized disclosure of Information in accordance 
with all applicable statutes, regulations, and orders. I will return all Information and all copies 
and reproductions thereof upon request of the FAA. I understand that the unauthorized 
disclosure, use, or mishandling of Information may adversely affect the owner of the 
Information, the national interest, and the conduct of federal programs. I understand that federal 



UAS Remote ID Demonstration           Page 2 of 2 
 

and state laws and regulations provide for criminal and civil penalties for improper disclosure, 
including but not limited to 5 U.S.C. § 552a; 41 U.S.C. §§ 2010-2017; and 18 U.S.C. §§ 641, 
1832, and 1905. 
 
____. The restrictions described in this Agreement do not extend to Information that has become 
generally known or available to the public without breach of this agreement; is disclosed with the 
prior written approval of the appropriate FAA Official; or (after notification to the appropriate 
FAA Official) is disclosed pursuant to a statutory requirement, regulatory requirement, or subject 
to the Order of a competent Court of United States jurisdiction.  
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